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Summary 
 

INTRODUCTION 
 
The success of the education system is affected by teachers’ qualifications. 

Communication qualifications are one of the important part of these skills. Teachers’ type of 
interaction styles not only effects children’s language development, but also improve their 
learnings (Baird, 2010). Young children cannot learn concepts as good as older children or 
adults. Because young children are mostly in pre-operational cognitive stage. Their vocabulary 
is limited, and their self-expression skills are in developmental progress. Educators are 
supposed to have instructional and literal skills that support children’s language 
development.  
 

METHOD 
 
Research Model 
This research was aimed to investigate educators’ communicational qualifications 

working in a hearing impaired special education institution in Ankara. One of the qualitative 
research methods, case study, was applied as a research methodology. For this purpose one of 
the special education institutions was selected using purposive sampling method among five 
other special education institutions. Twelve educators working in this institution were taken 
into the study on a voluntary base.  

 
Data Collection Tools 
‘Teacher Communication Qualification’ observation form was developed to observe 

and rate teachers’ communicational skills. This observation form consisted of four sub-
dimensions. These dimensions were determined as ‘teacher’s characteristics’, ‘supporting 
emerging language skills’, ‘creating opportunities for language use’ and ‘exposure to new 
vocabulary words and concepts’. Observed behaviors were encoded using these dimensions 
and their related items. Educators’ knowledge and opinions about communicational 
qualifications were collected through semi-structured interviews. Educators’ activity plans 
were also used to analyze pre-planned communicational opportunities for children. Results 
were presented for each educator. Then, educators’ communicational qualifications were 
presented in frequencies and percentages for each dimension. 
 

FINDINGS 
 
The observed communication qualities of educators were discussed in four sub-

dimensions (teacher’s characteristics, supporting emerging language skills, creating 
opportunities for language use and exposure to new vocabulary words and concepts).  
Accordingly, regarding the communication skills of educators who work with children in 
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early childhood period with slight hearing loss; it was determined that they behaved sincerely 
when communicating with children, controlling their emotions in communicating with 
children, adjusting their tone of voices appropriately and using the Turkish language 
effectively. The results showed that educators have a proper attitude to communicate 
personally with children when communicating with children. 

With regard to the support of the children’s developing language skills by educators 
working with children with slight hearing loss in early childhood, it has been determined that 
the students show moderate behaviors in terms of reducing the speed of speech to help the 
child understand the meaning, using the body language and gestures effectively, simplifying 
the subject expressing in different ways when the subject is not understood by the child, 
providing communication by establishing eye contact with the children and providing enough 
time for children to talk. The results show that when the qualities of communication become 
more technical in scope, the rates of having these behaviors by educators are becoming to 
decrease.   

With regard to the ability of educators working with children with slight hearing loss 
in early childhood to provide opportunities for language use, it has been determined that they 
do not show the necessary behaviors in terms of making problem situations for children to 
solve, making different examples about the word in children’s speech, making different 
examples about the words that the children do not understand or being a model and when the 
children cannot answer, they have been shown to give the clues about the answer to the 
question, helping the children to answer the questions, planning the activities that the children 
can interact with, encouraging the children to read books together and telling them that they 
can get help from other friends when they ask for help. The results show that the 
communication ratios become more technical and that the ratios of the educators to these 
behaviors are quite low when preliminary preparation is required.   

With regard to the ability of educators working with children with slight hearing loss 
in early childhood to present new words and concepts; it has been determined that children 
cannot demonstrate the necessary behaviors in describing the words they do not know using 
the words they know, using the words they have learned in different and appropriate forms, 
and using the appropriate materials to provide clear understanding of the words and express 
them clearly. In the teaching activities, it is moved from concrete to abstract, from known to 
unknown. There are different ways of fulfilling these principles. It has been observed that 
educators; while following these fundamental principles, do not have sufficient variety in their 
teaching methods. This research has shown that the communication qualities of educators 
should be developed in a way to support and diversify the general education activities as well 
as language development.  
 

RESULTS AND DISCUSSION 
 
Tepeli and Arı (2011) stated that communication skills of early childhood educators 

differ according to the undergraduate education they have. In the scope of this work, it was 
found that educators who have master’s degree or participated in a seminar related to 
communication have a behavior that shows more communication quality than others.  

In line with the conclusion obtained from the research, it was suggested to support by 
in-service trainings, seminars and trainings on the characteristics of children with disabilities 
and the needs to be communicated with them as well as educators working with children with 
disabilities at governmental agencies or private institutions. 


